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In many mountainous regions of the world, water for
ecological and human needs is derived from snow that
accumulates during the winter and spring, and melts
during the spring and summer each year. These
seasonal snowpacks serve as large natural water
reservoirs that are particular sensitive to effects of
climate warming. Changes to snow dynamics can
profoundly influence the hydrology and water quality of
snow-dominated mountainous environments. Given
projected changes to air temperature and precipitation
in mountains of the globe, there is an urgent need for
improved understanding of how both water availability
and water quality will respond to changing snowpack
conditions. In this Special Issue of Water, we invite
submissions focusing on the effects of climate change
on the hydrology and water quality of snow-dominated
mountainous regions through field-based investigations,
remote sensing observations, and/or modeling
experiments. We encourage papers that focus on how
changes to snow dynamics will influence the timing and
magnitude of streamflow runoff, hydrologic flowpaths,
soil moisture, and biogeochemical nutrient cycling.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
In the context of global changes, the sustainable
management of water cycles, going from global and
regional water cycles to urban, industrial and agricultural
water cycles, plays a very important role on the water
resources and on their relationships with food, energy,
biodiversity, ecosystem functioning and human health.
Water invites authors to provide innovative original full
articles, critical reviews and timely short
communications and to propose special issues devoted
to new technological and scientific domains and to
interdisciplinary approaches of the water cycles. We
ensure a critical review process and a quick turnaround
between submission and final decision.
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