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Message from the Guest Editors
With the gradual transformation of hydraulic engineering
from digitization and intelligence to wisdom, remote
sensing technology, artificial intelligence and deep
learning methods have been widely used for automatic
perception, processing, storage and analysis of
hydraulic structure engineering monitoring data. The
advent of remote sensing technologies such as three-
dimensional tilt photography offers the opportunity to
build an integrated hydraulic engineering monitoring
and acquisition system capable of capturing all the
details of hydraulic engineering. With the introduction of
artificial intelligence and deep learning methods, the
hydraulic engineering information was analysed and
exploited efficiently. Combined with the traditional
hydraulic structure behaviour analysis methods, such as
geotechnical testing and numerical simulation, artificial
intelligence and deep learning methods can help solve
more complex hydraulic engineering problems by
providing more accurate and professional intelligent
analysis and ubiquitous hydraulic engineering services
of great theoretical importance and application value in
order to achieve the general improvement of safety
monitoring......
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
In the context of global changes, the sustainable
management of water cycles, going from global and
regional water cycles to urban, industrial and agricultural
water cycles, plays a very important role on the water
resources and on their relationships with food, energy,
biodiversity, ecosystem functioning and human health.
Water invites authors to provide innovative original full
articles, critical reviews and timely short
communications and to propose special issues devoted
to new technological and scientific domains and to
interdisciplinary approaches of the water cycles. We
ensure a critical review process and a quick turnaround
between submission and final decision.
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