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Message from the Guest Editors

Microplastics have become a hot topic which has been
attracting more and more attention. Microplastics, ranging
from 1 µm to 5 mm in size, are tiny plastic particles made of
synthetic polymers of different shapes and colors.
Generally, microplastics come from two main sources
based on their generation, that is, the primary and
secondary source. These microplastics enter the aquatic
environment through various pathways, including runoff,
atmospheric deposition, wind, disposal, and so on. Lots of
reports have shown that these particles are distributed
widely in water, soil, and air in our planet, and ingested
directly and indirectly by various organisms, including
humans, resulting in unpredicted impacts on health. To
take precautionary measures to prevent the potential
ecosystem disaster and health risk caused by
microplastics, it is necessary to fill in the knowledge gaps of
microplastics in the environment, including the source,
distribution, and impacts on organisms, which are
important to address the global issue in the coming years.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

In the context of global changes, the sustainable
management of water cycles, going from global and
regional water cycles to urban, industrial and agricultural
water cycles, plays a very important role on the water
resources and on their relationships with food, energy,
biodiversity, ecosystem functioning and human health.
Water invites authors to provide innovative original full
articles, critical reviews and timely short communications
and to propose special issues devoted to new
technological and scientific domains and to
interdisciplinary approaches of the water cycles. We ensure
a critical review process and a quick turnaround between
submission and final decision.
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