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The automotive industry is rapidly evolving with the
integration of advanced technologies, such as
autonomous driving, electric propulsion, and connected
vehicles. With these advancements, the reliability of
automotive systems becomes crucial for ensuring
safety, performance, and customer satisfaction. This
Special Issue aims to explore the latest research and
advancements in the reliability analysis and evaluation
of automotive systems. The objective of this Special
Issue is to connect researchers, engineers, and
practitioners from academia and industry to share their
knowledge, experiences, and innovative approaches in
the field of automotive system reliability. We invite
original research articles, review papers, and case
studies that address various aspects of reliability
analysis, evaluation, and improvement in automotive
systems. We encourage researchers and experts in the
field to contribute their valuable insights and findings to
this Special Issue. By gathering and disseminating the
latest research, this Special Issue will contribute to the
advancement of reliability analysis and evaluation in
automotive systems, ultimately enhancing the safety
and
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Rapid Publication:
manuscripts are peer-reviewed and a first decision is
provided to authors approximately 22.1 days after
submission; acceptance to publication is undertaken in 3.6
days (median values for papers published in this journal in
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