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Message from the Guest Editor

Immune tolerance refers to a state of active and highly
regulated unresponsiveness of the immune system to self-
antigens or a specific antigen that can induce an immune
response in the body. It plays a crucial role in normal
physiology, and deficiencies in tolerance can lead to
autoimmune diseases.

In recent years, considerable progress has been made in
immune tolerance research, particularly in the fields of
immunotherapy, immunomodulation, and immune system
regulation. However, challenges persist due to incomplete
knowledge of the exact mechanisms, a lack of suitable
research models, and limited access to clinical data,
making it difficult to develop effective treatments for
diverse immune tolerance-related disorders.

This Special Issue will specifically address (but is not
limited to) the following two topics:

1. Cellular Aspects of Immune Tolerance in Health and
Diseases: The Role of Immune Cell Subtypes and
Their Crosstalk.

2. The Role of Commensal Microbiota in Immune
Tolerance and Vaccines.

We welcome all types of articles, including original
research, comprehensive and systematic reviews, brief
reports, etc. We eagerly anticipate receiving your
contributions.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Vaccines (ISSN 2076-393X) has had a 6-year history of
publishing peer-reviewed state of the art research that
advances the knowledge of immunology in human disease
protection. Immunotherapeutics, prophylactic vaccines,
immunomodulators, adjuvants and the global differences
in regulatory affairs are some of the highlights of the
research published that have shaped global health. Our
open access policy allows all researchers and interested
parties to immediately scrutinize the rigorous evidence our
publications have to offer. We are proud to present the
work and perspectives of many to contribute to future
decisions concerning human health.
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