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inventiveness, this Special Issue critically explores (but
is not limited to) these relevant topics: (1) How can we
govern current and future urban trends, enhancing the
dynamic synergies between the material and immaterial
data of a city (big data, IoT/IoE, sensor networks,
blockchain, etc.) (2) How can we govern the urban and
regional relationships without compromising urban-land
synergies (between the city and the territory), also in
term of mobility and of distributive logistics. (3) How
“smart city policies” have impact on the city and regional
economies, by making cities competitive at national and
international level (4) How can we govern the urban and
regional relationships between advanced technology
and metamorphosis smart city (competitiveness,
cohesion, conservation, …)
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Urban Science is a scholarly international journal which
provides a platform for the exchange of theories, ideas,
methods, analyses, and comparative studies of urban
and regional development. It is a peer-reviewed, open
access journal that publishes high quality original
articles, theoretical essays, critical reviews, research
notes, and shorter communications. Its broad definition
of “science” includes both quantitative and qualitative
methods of social, environmental, and spatial analysis.
There is no restriction on the maximum length of the
papers.
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