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Message from the Guest Editors

Dear Colleagues,

The International Conference, Lakeside Conference on
Protein Toxins and Effectors (LakesidePTE) focuses on
mechanistic studies on protein toxins and effectors. The
next LakesidePTE Conference will be held on 2-4 October
2022 at the Abbey Resort in Lake Geneva, WI, USA.

The Organizing Committee is collaborating with Toxins to
call for a Special Issue related to the research presented
during LakesidePTE. We are inviting, in person or virtual,
registrants of the conference to submit a manuscript or
review that has not been previously published.  We will
accept research articles, short communications, and review
articles. We anticipate that articles will contain new and
important findings discussed during the conference
including mechanistic aspects of protein toxin and effector
action, the discovery of new protein toxins or effectors, and
the study of protein toxin or effector action within cells, and
will engage in interbacterial competition, using cellular
microbiology approaches. All submissions will be peer-
reviewed.  

Link to the LakesidePTE Conference 2022:
http://event.fourwaves.com/lakesidePTE2022
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Editor-in-Chief

Prof. Dr. Jay Fox
Department of Microbiology,
University of Virginia,
Charlottesville, VA, USA

Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Toxinology is an incredibly diverse area of study, ranging
from field surveys of environmental toxins to the study of
toxin action at the molecular level. The editorial board and
staff of Toxins are dedicated to providing a timely, peer-
reviewed outlet for exciting, innovative primary research
articles and concise, informative reviews from investigators
in the myriad of disciplines contributing to our knowledge
on toxins. We are committed to meeting the needs of the
toxin research community by offering useful and timely
reviews of all manuscripts submitted. Please consider
Toxins when submitting your work for publication.
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