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The 3rd Conference on Nonlinearity is an international
conference that will be held on Sep 4—8, 2023. This is
the third conference in a series of conferences on
nonlinearity that we plan to continue in the future within
a period of two years. The 1st Conference on
Nonlinearity was held on Oct 11-12, 2019 in Belgrade,
Serbia, and the the 2nd Conference on Nonlinearity was
held on Oct 18-22, 2021. The main organizer is the
Serbian Academy of Nonlinear Sciences (SANS). There
are also several coorganizers from Serbia. We cordially
invite researchers working in these fields to contribute
original research papers or review articles to this Special
Issue. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Symmetry is ultimately the most important concept in
natural sciences. It is not surprising then that very basic
and fundamental research achievements are related to
symmetry. For instance, the Nobel Prize in Physics 1979
(Glashow, Salam, Weinberg) was received for a unified
symmetry description of electromagnetic and weak
interactions, while the Nobel Prize in Physics 2008
(Nambu, Kobayashi, Maskawa) was received for the
discovery of the mechanism of spontaneous breaking of
symmetry, including CP symmetry. Our journal is named
Symmetry and it manifests its fundamental role in
nature.
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