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The 2030 Agenda was approved in 2015, in which a total
of 193 UN countries agreed on the main global
challenges, assuming responsibility for addressing and
ending them, with concrete actions and a shared
commitment by all actors. This Agenda resulted in clear
goals, the 17 Sustainable Development Goals (SDGs). In
the new context derived from COVID-19, social and
solidarity economy can play an important role in
territorial and economic development, linked to the
SDGs. Social and solidarity economy entities are
positioned as privileged actors toward the achievement
of the SDGs, with a business model based on the
primacy of people, the equitable distribution of profits or
the reinvestment of profits. This model has been
endorsed by numerous actors, such as the UN Inter-
Agency Task Force on the Social and Solidarity
Economy, the ICA, the EESC or CIRIEC International. For
further reading, please visit the Special Issue Website. 
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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