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This Special Issue focuses on data-driven smart
sustainable cities. This is a new paradigm of urbanism
that has recently materialized in the light of the big data
revolution, or what has been termed as the fourth
paradigm of science as enabled by big data science and
analytics. This Special Issue also aims to offer a platform
for advancing sustainable cities and smart cities in
terms of sustainability, and more importantly for
integrating their strategies and solutions within the
framework of smart sustainable cities based on data-
driven technologies and solutions. The basic idea of
data-driven smart sustainable cities as a holistic
approach to urbanism is to explicitly bring together
sustainable cities and smart cities as urban endeavors
in order to build smart sustainable cities in ways that
continuously assess, optimize, and enhance their
performance with respect to the three dimensions of
sustainability as well as their synergistic and balanced
integration over the long run. We encourage
researchers, practitioners and scientists to submit
original research articles, case studies, reviews, critical
perspectives, and viewpoint articles.
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I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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