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The current COVID-19 pandemic has created massive
disruptions in supply, demand, and production. Such an
outbreak reveals the darkness in non-dynamism supply
chains. This Special Issue aims to address the
advantages and consequences of a dynamic and
resilient supply chain system along with its connected
elements. It would also help researchers and
practitioners to answer questions such as: how could
decision-making help managers in managing their
supply chain risks? How would decision-making improve
global supply chains in recovering from COVID- 19
pandemic disruptions in future? How would Industry 4.0
applications help in improving supply chain risk
management? This Special Issue looks for novel ideas,
strategies, and models first to aid the economy, and
then to push industrial and production partners to
rethink, feed, and maintain the local and international
markets after COVID-19 disruption. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international open
access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. The journal publishes original
research articles, reviews, conference proceedings
(peer reviewed full articles) and communications. I am
confident you will find the journal contributes to
enhancing understanding of sustainability and fostering
initiatives and applications of sustainability-based
measures and activities.
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