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Sustainability is increasingly a requirement of building
projects. Consequently, the fields of construction
management, project management, and engineering
are called on to recalibrate work practices and
processes to align them with sustainability objectives.
The scope of opportunities for engaging with
sustainable practices is large, ranging all the way from
mining and procurement, through design, materials, and
components manufacture; transportation; assembly;
commissioning; operations; maintenance; and
refurbishing, to eventual demolition and disposal. In the
midst of all this are smart technologies, and ever-
sophisticated operational systems that potentially
augment sustainable outcomes.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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