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Message from the Guest Editor
Interest in a Blue Economy has also been heightened
through a strategic lens of post-COVID-19 economic
recovery. However, the promise of a "Blue Economy" is
one that goes beyond purely economic interests and
includes interests in delivering large-scale
environmental protection alongside economic growth,
revitalizing coastal communities, and development
planning with Indigenous knowledge and concerns
considered. Any Blue Economy plan will need to
consider other national-level priorities, including
Canada's commitments to climate change action,
contributions to the Sustainable Development Goals
and global biodiversity agreements, Indigenous
reconciliation and justice, and policy development
through an intersectional lens. For this Special Issue, we
seek submissions relating to any one (or more) of these
topics and considerations of whether all goals can be
addressed at once.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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