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Effective energy utilization is a prerequisite for
economic growth, and the unwarranted usage of fossil
fuel is a detriment to the ecosystem. Using renewable
energy results in minimal greenhouse gas (GHG)
emissions; accordingly, many economies are striving to
foster energies from various renewable sources, e.g.,
hydro, solar, geothermal, and wind power. Renewable
energy has an important role in reducing ecological
pollution and global warming, and accomplishing
sustainable growth. 
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how policymakers can drive several strategies and
procedures for green and clean energy sustainability
and maintain ecological excellence and economic
development.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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