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With the increasing prominence and diversification of
human activities, extensive social interaction has
become a significant factor influencing the sustainable
development of future cities. Human beings can affect
the quality of the natural environment through various
forms of social activities, such as energy consumption,
population migration, culture propagation, etc. In turn,
the natural environment can affect the survival and
sustainability of human societies. This interactive
relation explains many of the obstacles that human
beings face in sustainable development, which can be
traced back to specific human activities. Thus,
transforming of human activities and adapting to the
dynamic changes of environment systems will
contribute to the sustainable development of future
cities, which will in turn benefit all of the stakeholders
involved.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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