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Ensuring sustainability practices across supply chains in
different industries has been a focus of research during
the past decades. Many countries and companies
prioritize such practices to reduce carbon emissions,
use fewer fossil resources and more renewable
resources, reduce waste, and improve labor
conditions.   The barriers to developing and
implementing sustainability practices, as well as the
potentially effective and innovative solutions toward a
more sustainable supply chain and logistics
management are welcome. With the advent of recent
technologies, such as the Internet of Things and
Blockchain, the roles and impacts of technologies and
innovative approaches in the identification and
improving sustainability practices are critical. This
Special Issue invites authors to contribute to the
research on impacts, barriers, and challenges, as well
as solutions, innovations, and successful practices in
Sustainable Supply Chain and Logistics Management.
We look forward to receiving your contributions. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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