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Specifically, a) development of new scientific and
technological approaches for mitigation of mining
activities in the marine environment, particularly the
deep system, b) development of new integrated
conceptual and technological systems for remediation
and recovery of contaminated sediments, c)
development of integrated observation platforms for
monitoring the marine–coastal system and mitigating
anthropogenic and natural impacts in the marine
environment, and d) development of integrated actions
of mitigation/environmental recovery of degraded
marine-coastal areas through the restoration of
Posidonia oceanica meadows and/or alternative marine
organisms. A specific focus is dedicated to the
socioeconomic analysis with respect to the application
of the proposed methods. This finding will support the
development of productive and sustainable marine
environmental policy systems.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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