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In the contemporary era, many challenges are being
faced by all the economies such as global warming, and
environmental deterioration which are due to inefficient
socio-ecological transformation. The huge growth in the
population and prosperity of the economies are
considered to be significant issues that pose a threat to
societies, economies, and natural systems. One solution
to address or mitigate these issues and improve the
performance of the systems with a focus on
sustainability is by embracing technological
advancements such as Artificial Intelligence (AI), IoT,
Blockchain, and ML concepts. The topics of interest
within the scope of this focused section include but are
not limited to:
- Challenges, and benefits of IoT, AI, and ML methods

for achieving sustainability.
- Application areas: Smart cities with a focus on smart

mobility, smart environment, and energy systems,
healthcare, supply chain management, human
resources, and the agricultural sector.

- Evaluation of the business performance taking into
account the sustainability aspects.

- Application of multi-criteria decision-making (MCDM)
approaches for analysing research problems in the
case area.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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