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- Marion Roberts (2019) has argued how key gender

issues in planning, including the agendas on care and
women’s representation, among others, have been
coopted by neoliberalism and largely voided of their
transformative capacity. According to Roberts, this
process was reinforced by the negative, if unintended,
consequences of the recent preeminence of
recognition versus redistribution as the core principle
underlying feminist agendas.  

- This special issue seeks to explore ways to buttress
the transformative potential of gender perspectives in
urban planning, by bringing redistribution back as a
core principle of gender equality agendas in urban
planning. 

- Suggest themes:
- Research on gender perspectives that address land-

use legislation and regulation, zoning ordinances,
regional planning, municipal level planning,
transportation planning, facility planning, infrastructure
planning, housing policies, regeneration and
redevelopment projects, and direct public
interventions in land and real estate markets, to create
gender responsive infrastructure, transportation,
facilities, employment spaces, and housing. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international open
access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. The journal publishes original
research articles, reviews, conference proceedings
(peer reviewed full articles) and communications. I am
confident you will find the journal contributes to
enhancing understanding of sustainability and fostering
initiatives and applications of sustainability-based
measures and activities.
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