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Sustainable business decision-making is crucial for
long-term success. It entails a proactive approach
where every decision, from product development to
resource management, carefully weighs its
environmental, social, and economic implications. From
strategic decisions such as business location to
technology selection, product quality, project portfolio
selection, the value of healthcare interventions and
public policies, and a myriad of management decisions
in (non)industrial settings require a compromise
between multiple conflicting qualitative and/or
quantitative criteria. To ensure long-term sustainability,
these decisions must be supported by multiple criteria
decision analysis and/or multiple objective decision-
making methodologies, methods, procedures, and
techniques that provide a scientifically robust decision-
making framework while balancing economic,
environmental, and social factors. In this Special Issue,
entitled “Decision-Making in Sustainable Management”,
theoretical papers and practical case studies involving
multiple criteria and objectives from any research field
are welcome.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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