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The COVID-19 pandemic has resulted in changes to
people’s preferences, business interactions, and market
dynamics worldwide. While this applies for virtually all
industries, the tourism industry is significant in that it is
the most affected, and at the same time, the future
challenges in this industry are difficult to anticipate.
Meanwhile, many also view this shock as an opportunity
to improve the industry infrastructure, operating
efficiency, and long-term stability. However, the
achievement of these objectives depends on the
successful adoption of the smart tourism technologies
of the industry, as well as the digitalization of products,
the marketplace, and human resources.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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