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(1) Introduction, including scientific background and
highlighting the importance of this research area. This
Special Issue, entitled “Sustainable Development of
Agricultural Systems”, draws on current interdisciplinary
research, focusing on the exploration and application of
regenerative agricultural practices and tackling
contentious issues such as carbon farming, livestock
emissions, systems of rice intensification, and
conservation grazing. (2) Aim of the Special Issue and
how the subject relates to the journal scope The Special
Issue aims to explore pathways towards sustainable
development in agricultural systems. It aligns closely
with the journal’s interdisciplinary scope by delving into
the complexities of sustainable agriculture, and
shedding light on innovative strategies and trends that
can contribute to the advancement of more resilient,
equitable, and sustainable agricultural systems.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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