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Message from the Guest Editors
The world is facing climate change, a shortage of natural
resources, and other environmental and socioeconomic
problems which are caused by unsustainable production
and consumption. By applying a circular approach to our
current production and consumption habits, a healthier
environment and more sustainable society and
economy can be achieved. Circular approaches are
applicable to the whole supply chain, from resource
extraction, production, and use to the end of the use of
the product. This approach maintains the product’s
value for as long as possible to minimize waste and
pollution and to improve the value of the resources
used. It not only brings direct economic benefits to
businesses, but also has positive impacts on society
through job creation and improving the working
environment, consequently targeting all three pillars of
sustainability. This Special Issue aims to present a
collection on the application of circular approaches, in
theory and in practice, for a more sustainable world.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
I encourage you to contribute a research or
comprehensive review article for consideration for
publication in Sustainability, an international Open
Access journal which provides an advanced forum for
research findings in areas related to sustainability and
sustainable development. Sustainability publishes
original research articles, review articles and
communications. I am confident you will find the journal
contributes to enhancing understanding of sustainability
and fostering initiatives and applications of
sustainability-based measures and activities.
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