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Cities are places of organization of collective interests,
evolving quickly as they depend on social, cultural, and
technological changes. By developing public policies
and creating physical and social environments that
enable citizens to mutually support each other in
carrying out all functions of life and achieving their full
potential, cities can become Healthy Cities (World
Health Organization). Multirisk analysis, urban and
territorial plans, land use pattern, mobility system,
greenspace design, people awareness, and social
perception of risks are some of the key elements to
develop advance planning in order to reduce any kind of
urban risks and to better support and enhance city
health. Authors are invited to contribute to this Special
Issue by submitting theoretical and empirical studies
and policy-related and practice-related contributions
addressing any of the above topics.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Societies (ISSN 2075-4698) is an interdisciplinary
journal that brings together different scientific
approaches to engage with societal questions to
enhance our understanding of the social realm
throughout history. The journal publishes original
empirical research papers, literature reviews, and
conceptual papers. Our aim is to publish papers that
have a significant impact on addressing present and
emerging societal questions. Therefore, we encourage
researchers to publish their results in as much detail as
possible. For empirical research papers and literature
reviews, all experimental details must be provided, so
that the results are reproducible. We also encourage the
publication of timely theoretical pieces on topics of
interest to existing and emerging societal questions.
Papers are either published in the open journal or in
Special Issues devoted to specific topics of interest to
the field.
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