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The COVID-19 pandemic has caused significant
disruptions to social and cultural norms, resulting in
changes in the way individuals perceive and interact
with each other. These changes are particularly evident
in the context of immigration, where the pandemic has
exacerbated existing challenges and created new ones.
The proposed Special Issue aims to explore the cultural
psychological perspective of immigrants’ ingroup–
outgroup interaction during the social change brought
about by the COVID-19 pandemic. Specifically, this
Special Issue seeks to investigate how the pandemic
has affected immigrants’ relationships with both their
ingroup and outgroup members. It aims to investigate
how cultural values, beliefs, and practices influence
immigrants’ perceptions of their ingroup and outgroup
members during the pandemic. The COVID-19
pandemic has had an impact on the acculturation
processes of immigrants, including their adaptation to
the host culture and maintenance of their heritage
culture, and has had influenced intergroup relations,
with either negative or positive consequences.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Societies (ISSN 2075-4698) is an interdisciplinary
journal that brings together different scientific
approaches to engage with societal questions to
enhance our understanding of the social realm
throughout history. The journal publishes original
empirical research papers, literature reviews, and
conceptual papers. Our aim is to publish papers that
have a significant impact on addressing present and
emerging societal questions. Therefore, we encourage
researchers to publish their results in as much detail as
possible. For empirical research papers and literature
reviews, all experimental details must be provided, so
that the results are reproducible. We also encourage the
publication of timely theoretical pieces on topics of
interest to existing and emerging societal questions.
Papers are either published in the open journal or in
Special Issues devoted to specific topics of interest to
the field.
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