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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

Evidence suggests that young people are becoming
disillusioned with democracy in many contemporary
societies. This is most visibly reflected in a global pattern of
generational electoral inequality that sees them
significantly less likely to participate in electorally-based
politics than their older contemporaries. However, there
are two important caveats. Firstly, there is considerable
debate as to whether such developments are permanent or
reversible. Secondly, there is evidence that their apparent
disconnection from institutionalised politics has its parallel
in a global tendency towards participation in new styles of
action that seem to better fit their political aspirations.

This Special Issue of Societies intends to explore the
realities of youth participation in different societies. We
invite manuscripts of original research and
conceptualization that address the diverse practices and
motivations of youth as they seek to effect social and
political change. Contributions are welcome from scholars,
youth practitioners and activists operating in a range of
different settings and using diverse disciplinary
perspectives.

Prof. Matt Henn
Guest Editor

For further info please visit the Societies Special Edition at:
http://www.mdpi.com/journal/societies/special_issues/Youth_and_Social
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Societies (ISSN 2075-4698) is an interdisciplinary journal
that brings together different scientific approaches to
engage with societal questions to enhance our
understanding of the social realm throughout history. The
journal publishes original empirical research papers,
literature reviews, and conceptual papers. Our aim is to
publish papers that have a significant impact on
addressing present and emerging societal questions.
Therefore, we encourage researchers to publish their
results in as much detail as possible. For empirical
research papers and literature reviews, all experimental
details must be provided, so that the results are
reproducible. We also encourage the publication of timely
theoretical pieces on topics of interest to existing and
emerging societal questions. Papers are either published in
the open journal or in Special Issues devoted to specific
topics of interest to the field.
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