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One major and growing portion of the world's food
production is the generation of food by-products. While
these by-products pose challenges, they offer a unique
opportunity as low-cost, renewable, and abundant
resources for extracting natural bioactive compounds.
However, the challenge lies in identifying the most
efficient extraction processes that preserve the integrity
of these sensitive bioactive compounds. Traditional
extraction techniques often degrade the quality and
potency of these components, making it critical to
explore alternative approaches. Emerging green
technologies—such as microwave-assisted extraction,
ultrasound-assisted extraction, etc.,—are increasingly
being recognized for their ability to overcome these
limitations, offering innovative and sustainable solutions.
This Special Issue aims to fill the gap in the literature by
sharing cutting-edge knowledge on optimizing these
processes and utilizing food by-products. We invite you
to contribute your research articles, communications, or
reviews exploring novel bioactive compounds extraction
processes from food by-products.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Separations offers the scientific community a high-
quality, open-access journal option with rapid time-to-
publication without any sacrifice of a rigorous peer-
review process. We invite contributions ranging from
fundamental characterization and instrumentation
development through application of techniques to shed
light on a broad spectrum of separation science needs.
Since inception, Separations, has become unique in its
combination of rapid publication and thorough scientific
content. We invite you to consider us for your next
contribution.
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High Visibility:
indexed within Scopus, SCIE (Web of Science), CAPlus /
SciFinder, and other databases.

Rapid Publication:
manuscripts are peer-reviewed and a first decision is
provided to authors approximately 16.3 days after
submission; acceptance to publication is undertaken in 2.7
days (median values for papers published in this journal in
the first half of 2025).

Recognition of Reviewers:
reviewers who provide timely, thorough peer-review
reports receive vouchers entitling them to a discount on
the APC of their next publication in any MDPI journal, in
appreciation of the work done.
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