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The Wireless Sensors/actuators (actors) Networks
(WSNs) support several important and critical
applications areas, the most important of which is
probably the critical real-time industrial/factory
applications domain. The rapid evolution of the WSNs
technologies and the increasing smartness of
instrumentation are leading the industrial sector to
evolve and reach the industry 4.0 era. This Special Issue
will provide an opportunity for researchers to publish
their original achievements related to the above
mentioned aspects which characterize the real-time
industrial WSNs as a whole.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Sensors is a leading journal devoted to fast publication
of the latest achievements of technological
developments and scientific research in the huge area
of physical, chemical and biochemical sensors,
including remote sensing and sensor networks. Both
experimental and theoretical papers are published,
including all aspects of sensor design, technology, proof
of concept and application. Sensors organizes Special
Issues devoted to specific sensing areas and
applications each year.
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