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The 18th International Conference on Mechatronics-
Mechatronika 2018 (https://mechatronika.fel.cvut.cz/)
will be held during December 5–7, 2018, Brno, Czech
Republic. The program will consist of contributed
papers, there will be no more than two parallel sessions,
depending upon topic grouping. Themes will be drawn
from, but not limited to the following: Modeling and
Simulation, Robotics, Actuators and Control, Power
Electronics, Information and Communication
Technologies, Industrial Applications, Energy
Harvesting, Sensors, Measurement and Diagnostics,
Military Technologies, Biomechatronics, Industry 4.0,
and Education. Authors of the selected papers from the
conference are invited to submit the extended versions
of their original papers and contributions. 
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Sensors is a leading journal devoted to fast publication
of the latest achievements of technological
developments and scientific research in the huge area
of physical, chemical and biochemical sensors,
including remote sensing and sensor networks. Both
experimental and theoretical papers are published,
including all aspects of sensor design, technology, proof
of concept and application. Sensors organizes Special
Issues devoted to specific sensing areas and
applications each year.
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