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Connected intelligent sensing reshapes our society by
empowering people with increasing new ways of mutual
interactions. As integration technologies keep their
scaling roadmap, the horizon of sensory applications is
rapidly widening, thanks to myriad light-weight self-
powered smart devices with high-connectivity
capabilities. Furthermore, the cost-effective large-scale
manufacturing associated with these integration
technologies makes their usage in low-end and
disposable sensing devices also possible. In any case,
integrated circuits based on CMOS technologies is
clearly the best candidate to supply the required
smartness and to pioneer these emerging sensory
systems. As a result, new challenges are arising around
the design of these integrated circuits and systems for
sensory applications in terms of low-power edge
computing, remote and self-powering strategies, low-
range wireless communications and low-cost device
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Sensors is a leading journal devoted to fast publication
of the latest achievements of technological
developments and scientific research in the huge area
of physical, chemical and biochemical sensors,
including remote sensing and sensor networks. Both
experimental and theoretical papers are published,
including all aspects of sensor design, technology, proof
of concept and application. Sensors organizes Special
Issues devoted to specific sensing areas and
applications each year.
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