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Recent advances in sensor technology have allowed the
development of many interesting solutions to extract
and process clinical information and data useful to
discover significant hidden patterns, aiming to define
predictive algorithms, methodologies, and tools for the
prediction of anomalous behavior, for the study and the
classification of diseases. Bioimaging sensors can
furnish quantitative measurements to physicians that
they can use in a decision support system for scientific
hypotheses and medical diagnoses, treatment, and
follow-up. This Special Issue aims to present and report
recent advances and trends concerning novel solutions
and technologies in bioimaging sensors and processing,
with applications in clinical practice. For detailed
information, please visit here. 
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Sensors is a leading journal devoted to fast publication
of the latest achievements of technological
developments and scientific research in the huge area
of physical, chemical and biochemical sensors,
including remote sensing and sensor networks. Both
experimental and theoretical papers are published,
including all aspects of sensor design, technology, proof
of concept and application. Sensors organizes Special
Issues devoted to specific sensing areas and
applications each year.
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