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Message from the Guest Editors
It is with great pleasure that we invite you to contribute
to our Special Issue entitled "New Trend for Gas Sensor
Development: From Sensing Materials to Metrological
Evaluation". Gas sensors are an integral part of everyday
life and are crucial for monitoring indoor and outdoor air
quality. The constant emissions from industry,
households and vehicles have a profound effect on our
living environment. In this context, there is an urgent
need for research and development focused on gas
sensors based on innovative materials with improved
metrological performance.  Our Special Issue seeks
both research and review papers that contribute to the
meteorological characterization of chemical–physical
innovative materials for the design and fabrication of
sensors and sensor-based measurement systems. We
are particularly interested in papers detailing the
structural characterization and analysis of sensing
properties in advanced and novel materials. We also
welcome new theoretical and experimental insights into
gas sensing mechanisms, as well as innovative
transduction mechanisms operating across a wide
frequency range, from DC to microwave frequencies.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Sensors is a leading journal devoted to fast publication
of the latest achievements of technological
developments and scientific research in the huge area
of physical, chemical and biochemical sensors,
including remote sensing and sensor networks. Both
experimental and theoretical papers are published,
including all aspects of sensor design, technology, proof
of concept and application. Sensors organizes Special
Issues devoted to specific sensing areas and
applications each year.
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