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This Special Issue comprises selected papers from the
Proceedings of the 4th International Electronic
Conference on Sensors and Applications, held 15–30
November 2017 on sciforum.net, an online platform for
hosting scholarly e-conferences and discussion groups.
In this 4th edition of the electronic conference,
contributors were invited to provide papers and
presentations from the field of sensors and applications
at large, resulting in a wide variety of excellent
submissions and topic areas. Selected papers which
attracted the most interest on the web, or that provided
a particularly innovative contribution, have been
gathered for publication. These papers have been
subjected to peer review and are published with the aim
of rapid and wide dissemination of research results,
developments and applications. We hope this
Conference Series will grow rapidly in the future and
become recognized as a new way and venue by which to
(electronically) present new developments related to the
field of sensors and their applications.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Sensors is a leading journal devoted to fast publication
of the latest achievements of technological
developments and scientific research in the huge area
of physical, chemical and biochemical sensors,
including remote sensing and sensor networks. Both
experimental and theoretical papers are published,
including all aspects of sensor design, technology, proof
of concept and application. Sensors organizes Special
Issues devoted to specific sensing areas and
applications each year.
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