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Natural risk assessment is one of the disciplines that
has seen the greatest advances in the field of GIS and
remote sensing in recent years. The implementation of
more sophisticated analysis methodologies, more
accurate remote sensing systems, more innovative
damage assessment protocols, etc., are some of the
various tools that have improved the management of
these phenomena. This Special Issue aims to provide an
outlet for peer-reviewed publications that implement
state-of-the-art methods and techniques incorporating
RS technology, ML methods and GIS so as to map,
monitor, evaluate and assess natural hazards. Potential
topics of interest include (but are not limited to) regional
or global case studies concerning natural risk
phenomena prediction and assessment, software
development and the implementation of machine
learning, optimization, deep learning techniques, meta-
heuristic algorithms and risk mapping methodology.  
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Sensors is a leading journal devoted to fast publication
of the latest achievements of technological
developments and scientific research in the huge area
of physical, chemical and biochemical sensors,
including remote sensing and sensor networks. Both
experimental and theoretical papers are published,
including all aspects of sensor design, technology, proof
of concept and application. Sensors organizes Special
Issues devoted to specific sensing areas and
applications each year.
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