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The Safe System Approach (SSA) is a proactive,
systemic framework for minimizing harm and enhancing
safety across various domains, including road transport
and occupational industrial settings. Unlike traditional
safety management, SSA acknowledges human fallibility
and emphasizes a multi-layered approach, integrating
safe infrastructure, technology, regulations, and
organizational culture to prevent severe consequences
of human errors. This Special Issue explores the
progress, challenges, and innovations in implementing
SSA across different sectors. Contributions will examine
practical applications, policy developments,
technological advancements, evaluation studies,
implementation frameworks, and behavioral
interventions that support SSA adoption and evaluation.
Additionally, this Special Issue will address barriers to
implementation, cross-sector learnings, and strategies
for fostering resilient safety cultures. By bridging
research and practice, this collection will advance
knowledge on making SSA an operational reality in
diverse safety-critical environments.
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