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The Special Issue aims to celebrate the contributions 
from University of Warsaw in remote searing area in the
past 60 years. We would like to collect a wide spectrum
of the newest ideas developed by University of Warsaw
staff members and our colleagues, who were our
students, colleagues, friends with whom we carried out
research projects, who enriched our knowledge through
their constructive comments, discussions, organization
of scientific meetings, and implementation of different
ideas, but also pleasant conversations in which remote
sensing was the key topic. At the same time, we would
like to thank our teachers and older colleagues who
introduced us to remote sensing, creating a place that
has become part of our research and teaching passion,
allowing us to find a place to fulfill our professional
dreams. We would like to thank our younger colleagues,
who want to spend their free time supporting us, as well.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Remote Sensing is now a prominent international journal
of repute in the world of remote sensing and spatial
sciences, as a pioneer and pathfinder in open access
format. It has highly accomplished global remote
sensing scientists on the editorial board and a
dedicated team of associate editors. The journal
emphasizes quality and novelty and has a rigorous peer-
review process. It is now one of the top remote sensing
journals with a significant Impact Factor, and a goal to
become the best journal in remote sensing in the
coming years. I strongly recommend Remote Sensing
for your best research publications for a fast
dissemination of your research.
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