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Seismic interferometry takes advantage of existing
(ambient) wavefield recordings through the generation
of so-called virtual sources. The medium’s response to
these virtual sources can be harnessed to image and/or
monitor that medium. A myriad of applications has
emerged that, in one way or another, benefit from this
technique. Examples vary from glacial monitoring using
ambient seismic noise to the monitoring of deep-ocean
temperatures using acoustic noise. Industrial
applications include monitoring geothermal reservoirs
using multiply scattered surface waves, Marchenko
redatuming in the context of seismic exploration, and
CO2 storage monitoring using ambient body-wave
energy. We invite studies on all types of (system-Earth
related) interferometric applications, as well as papers
highlighting recent methodological advances in the field
of seismic interferometry. Studies of interest may
therefore involve large-N arrays, distributed acoustic
sensing, machine learning, full-waveform inversion,
surface-wave extraction, noise characterization,
hydroacoustic monitoring, and other recent
advancements in the field of seismic interferometry.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Remote Sensing is now a prominent international journal
of repute in the world of remote sensing and spatial
sciences, as a pioneer and pathfinder in open access
format. It has highly accomplished global remote
sensing scientists on the editorial board and a
dedicated team of associate editors. The journal
emphasizes quality and novelty and has a rigorous peer-
review process. It is now one of the top remote sensing
journals with a significant Impact Factor, and a goal to
become the best journal in remote sensing in the
coming years. I strongly recommend Remote Sensing
for your best research publications for a fast
dissemination of your research.
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