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With the eminent advancements in the field of
nanotechnology and their provision of numerous viable
solutions to meet the challenges related to diagnostics,
treatments, bioelectronics, and environmental
applications, there is expanding demand for the further
development and design of nanobiosensors. The
design/construction of compact nanobiosensor devices
can result in the provision of numerous unique features,
including accurate detection, high selectivity at
ultraconcentrations, convenience, ease of use, low cost,
and a wide scope of utilization and on-site
implementation. The design and production of
nanobiosensors requires an incredible effort, resulting
from the merging and integration of many research
disciplines including engineering disciplines, materials
science, environmental, chemical, biological, and
medical sciences. In this regard, the current issue
intends to highlight advanced research studies in the
field of design, manufacturing, and environment
applications of nanobiosensors.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are invited to contribute either a research article or
a comprehensive review for consideration and
publication in Processes (ISSN 2227-9717). Processes is
published in open access format – research articles,
reviews, and other content are released on the internet
immediately after acceptance. The scientific community
and the general public have unlimited, free access to
the content. As an open access journal, Processes is
supported by the authors and their institutes through the
payment of article processing charges (APCs) for
accepted papers. We would be pleased to welcome you
as one of our authors.
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