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Recent advancements in photocatalysis and
electrocatalysis highlight their growing industrial
potential for sustainable chemical processes. Key
developments include high-performance catalysts (e.g.,
doped metal oxides, layered double hydroxides) and
innovative reactor designs (e.g., flow-through
photoreactors), enabling applications like CO2
conversion and hydrogen production.  This Special Issue
seeks high-quality works that focus on recent
breakthroughs, engineering strategies, and
demonstrated applications of these technologies at the
pilot or industrial scale. Topics of interest include, but
are not limited to, the following: Design and
development of photocatalysts and electrocatalysts for
industrial use; Integration of catalytic systems in CO2
reduction, hydrogen production, and pollutant
treatment; Reactor design, flow systems, and process
intensification; Coupled photocatalytic–electrocatalytic
processes for enhanced efficiency; Techno-economic
and lifecycle assessments of industrial applications;
Case studies and demonstrations in industrial or near-
industrial conditions.
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About the Journal
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You are invited to contribute either a research article or
a comprehensive review for consideration and
publication in Processes (ISSN 2227-9717). Processes is
published in open access format – research articles,
reviews, and other content are released on the internet
immediately after acceptance. The scientific community
and the general public have unlimited, free access to
the content. As an open access journal, Processes is
supported by the authors and their institutes through the
payment of article processing charges (APCs) for
accepted papers. We would be pleased to welcome you
as one of our authors.
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