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Today the world has serious energy problems due to
various technological developments and the large
energy consumption. In order to meet the exponential
growth in energy demand, new energy systems must be
developed to replace fossil fuels in order to limit CO2
emissions to ensure a sustainable future environment.
Solar cells have been studied for a long time as a next-
generation energy system owing to their promise as an
environmentally friendly and infinite energy source. The
aim of this Special Issue is to highlight the progress and
phenomena related to organic electronic devices such
as photovoltaic cells, photo-sensors, thin film
transistors, and light-emitting diodes, etc. We look
forward to your contribution describing your recent
promising research. We cordially ask you to consider
submitting your next research paper or review article to
this thematic issue. You could enjoy a 20% early bird
discount if you submit your paper by 30 June 2020.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Since its foundation in 2009, Polymers has developed
into an internationally renowned, extremely successful
open access journal. The editorial team and the editorial
board dedicatedly combine open-access publishing and
high-quality rigorous peer reviewing. The performance
of the journal has proven this strategy to be well-suited
and highly successful. This is reflected in the increasing
impact factor of Polymers, the most recent one being
4.7.
I would like to invite you to contribute to the success of
the journal by sending us your high quality research
papers. We would be pleased to welcome you as one of
our authors.
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