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Conjugated polymer networks (CPNs) are a fascinating
class of materials that combine the electronic
properties of conjugated polymers with the mechanical
robustness and stability of cross-linked systems. They
are promising for applications such as organic
photovoltaics (OPVs), light-emitting diodes (OLEDs),
sensors, field-effect transistors (OFETs), and
electrochromic devices. Their structural versatility
enables precise tuning of optoelectronic properties,
charge transport, and environmental stability through
the chemical design of the backbone, side chains, and
cross-linking strategies. This Special Issue aims to
present recent advances in the synthesis,
characterization, processing, and application of CPNs.
Topics include innovative synthetic routes, structure–
property relationships, nanostructuring techniques, and
device integration. Contributions on green processing
methods, self-healing materials, and applications in
bioelectronics and energy storage are also welcome.
Both original research articles and reviews are
encouraged.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Since its foundation in 2009, Polymers has developed
into an internationally renowned, extremely successful
open access journal. The editorial team and the editorial
board dedicatedly combine open-access publishing and
high-quality rigorous peer reviewing. The performance
of the journal has proven this strategy to be well-suited
and highly successful. This is reflected in the increasing
impact factor of Polymers, the most recent one being
4.9.
I would like to invite you to contribute to the success of
the journal by sending us your high quality research
papers. We would be pleased to welcome you as one of
our authors.
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