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Plant cell walls are intricately involved in many
processes in plants like cell morphogenesis and
responses to biotic and abiotic stress; they also form
the largest carbon sinks on the planet, and are of
interest to society with respect to sustainable energy
and food production. This situation ensures that cell
wall-related processes are of interest to a large number
of plant scientists while also making research
challenging due to the chemical complexity of cell walls,
their dynamic nature, and their involvement in many
processes. Recent years have seen the development
and application of novel analytical technologies, which
have fundamentally changed the options of the
community to investigate cell wall-related processes.
This has led to exciting new insights into the processes
modifying cell wall composition and structure as well as
the contributions of cell walls to processes like plant-
pathogen interactions and cell elongation. In this
Special Issue, articles are welcome that provide both a
snapshot of recent developments in the field and some
indications of exciting future research areas.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Plants is an open access journal which provides an
advanced forum for research findings in areas related to
plant function, its physiology, biology, taxonomy,
stresses, and its interactions with other organisms. It
publishes original research articles, reviews, reports,
conference proceedings (peer reviewed full articles) and
communications. In original research papers, it is
important that full experimental details are provided. We
also encourage timely reviews and commentaries on
topics of interest to the plant research community.
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