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Supercritical fluids and compressed gases act as a
solvent, antisolvent, solute, plasticizer, atomizing gas,
and carrier fluid. Using these various mechanisms,
supercritical fluids and compressed gases have been
widely used in the application and development of
various pharmaceutical processes, such as particle
formation, atomization, mixing, drying, extraction,
impregnation, melting, adsorption, milling, foaming,
coating, extrusion, etc. Supercritical antisolvent, spray
drying, fluid bed coating, and jet milling are typically
included in these pharmaceutical processes. In addition,
there have been promising advances in pharmaceutical
technology using supercritical fluids and compressed
gases through the application to various pharmaceutical
drug delivery systems, such as solid dispersion,
microsphere, dry powder inhaler, porous carrier, and
aerogel. In recent years, some hybrid processes via a
combination of supercritical fluids and compressed
gases have also been introduced. The aim of this
Special Issue is to introduce the recent developments
and findings for all topics related to the application of
supercritical fluid and compressed gas in
pharmaceutical technology.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Pharmaceutics (ISSN 1999-4923) is an online open
access journal on the science and technology of
pharmaceutics and biopharmaceutics. The scientific
community, the wider community and the general public
have unlimited and free access to the content as soon
as a paper is published; this open access to your
research ensures your findings are shared with the
widest possible audience. Please consider publishing
your impressive work in this high quality journal. We
would be pleased to welcome you as one of our authors.
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Rapid Publication:
manuscripts are peer-reviewed and a first decision is
provided to authors approximately 14.9 days after
submission; acceptance to publication is undertaken in 3.3
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