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Topical therapy is often preferred to a systemic one
because it allows treating the pathological site, avoiding
healthy tissues. The success of a local therapy derives
from the use of a suitable active ingredient adequately
formulated. Many formulations show a limited low
residence time responsible for partial and incomplete
treatment. This is responsible for delayed healing times
and risks of recurrence in the case of infections. This
problem is particularly emphasized in the case of ulcers
of both skin and mucosa. The development of new
technologies that are able to enhance the residence
time of topically applied drugs is necessary for the
treatment of local pathologies. In this context,
bioadhesive delivery systems are strategic and useful
tools for the local treatment of skin and mucosal
diseases. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Pharmaceutics (ISSN 1999-4923) is an online open
access journal on the science and technology of
pharmaceutics and biopharmaceutics. The scientific
community, the wider community and the general public
have unlimited and free access to the content as soon
as a paper is published; this open access to your
research ensures your findings are shared with the
widest possible audience. Please consider publishing
your impressive work in this high quality journal. We
would be pleased to welcome you as one of our authors.
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manuscripts are peer-reviewed and a first decision is
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