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Alzheimer’s disease (AD) is the most common
neurodegenerative disease that represents the principal
cause of dementia worldwide. The social and economic
burden behind this disease affects families, caregivers
and, obviously, patients. Numerous factors are involved
in the onset and progression of AD, but the exact
mechanisms leading to the accumulation of �-amyloid
(A�) protein and the formation of neurofibrillary tangles
of tau protein in the brain are still unresolved. In addition
to the effort spent searching for new innovative
treatments which are able to stop the progression of AD,
to date, all treatments available are only applicable to
symptomatic patients. Thus, the identification of
modifications that accumulate with aging in the AD brain
is certainly needed to discover new successful
therapeutic approaches. In this Special Issue,
“Treatment of Alzheimer Disease”, we invite
investigators to contribute original research articles and
review articles regarding the novel therapeutic
approaches to counteract AD progression.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Because of your expertise in the field of drug sciences, I
kindly invite you to consider publishing your current
work, in the form of a research article or a review, in the
open access electronic journal Pharmaceuticals.
Pharmaceuticals is characterized by an active editorial
board and a dynamic editorial staff. Manuscripts are
peer-reviewed and a final decision is provided to
authors within 4–6 weeks after submission. Papers are
published on the web immediately after acceptance. For
details on the submission process or any other matter,
please do not hesitate to contact us.
We hope to handle your contribution to Pharmaceuticals
soon.
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