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As you are perfectly aware, RNA viruses are one of the
leading causes of infectious animal, human and
zoonotic diseases worldwide, affecting millions of
people, as clearly exemplified by the current devastating
epidemic of the recently identified SARS-CoV-2 that has
already infected more than 50 million people and
caused more than 1.2 million deaths. Vaccine
development has had an enormous impact on
overcoming the global burden of diseases throughout
the use of a vast number of classical and state of the art
approaches, from purified inactivated and live
attenuated viruses, to nucleic acid (DNA or RNA)-based
candidates, virus-like particles, subunit elements, and
recombinant viruses. However, licensed vaccines are
only available for a few RNA viruses, and, thus, new and
improved vaccines are necessary for many others.
Therefore, to achieve a more comprehensive
understanding of the current trends in vaccine
development against RNA viruses, this Pharmaceuticals
Special Issue is dedicated to recent developments and
technological progress in vaccinology against RNA
viruses, and the molecular mechanisms and immune
responses involved.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Because of your expertise in the field of drug sciences, I
kindly invite you to consider publishing your current
work, in the form of a research article or a review, in the
open access electronic journal Pharmaceuticals.
Pharmaceuticals is characterized by an active editorial
board and a dynamic editorial staff. Manuscripts are
peer-reviewed and a final decision is provided to
authors within 4–6 weeks after submission. Papers are
published on the web immediately after acceptance. For
details on the submission process or any other matter,
please do not hesitate to contact us.
We hope to handle your contribution to Pharmaceuticals
soon.
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