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Computer-aided molecular modeling and simulation has
become an essential tool in drug design, allowing
researchers to study and understand molecular
interactions between a drug candidate and its target.
This field combines principles from computational
chemistry, bioinformatics, and biophysics to simulate
and visualize the behavior of molecules at the atomic
level. Many computational methods are also used to
predict the toxicity and pharmacokinetic properties of
drug candidates. For example, QSAR models can be
used to predict the activity of a drug candidate based on
its chemical structure, while ADME models can predict
how the drug candidate will behave in a person’s body.
Overall, computer-aided molecular modeling and
simulation techniques are important tools in modern
drug design, allowing researchers to identify potential
drug candidates more efficiently and accurately than
traditional experimental methods can. In this Special
Issue, we aim to draw together research from experts in
the field that highlight traditional and new computational
methods and strategies to discover and design new
drugs for clinical treatments.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Because of your expertise in the field of drug sciences, I
kindly invite you to consider publishing your current
work, in the form of a research article or a review, in the
open access electronic journal Pharmaceuticals.
Pharmaceuticals is characterized by an active editorial
board and a dynamic editorial staff. Manuscripts are
peer-reviewed and a final decision is provided to
authors within 4–6 weeks after submission. Papers are
published on the web immediately after acceptance. For
details on the submission process or any other matter,
please do not hesitate to contact us.
We hope to handle your contribution to Pharmaceuticals
soon.
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