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Biological proteins are essential intra- and extracellular
components for maintaining homeostasis in a wide
variety of living organisms, and some of them have vital
physiological activities. Several bioactive protein
products, such as enzymes, coagulation factors, and
hormonal preparations, have been developed and used
in modern medical care contributing to human health
and welfare. In addition, biological proteins such as
albumin and immunoglobulin (antibody) have been used
as biomaterials to solve clinical problems by taking
advantage of their inherent structure and unique
functions.  This Special Issue of Pharmaceuticals on
“Protein-Based Biomaterial for Pharmaceutical and
Biomedical Applications” will include both original
articles and reviews focused on protein- and
biotechnology-based products/materials aimed for use
in medicine, pharmaceutical, imaging, and diagnostic
applications.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Because of your expertise in the field of drug sciences, I
kindly invite you to consider publishing your current
work, in the form of a research article or a review, in the
open access electronic journal Pharmaceuticals.
Pharmaceuticals is characterized by an active editorial
board and a dynamic editorial staff. Manuscripts are
peer-reviewed and a final decision is provided to
authors within 4–6 weeks after submission. Papers are
published on the web immediately after acceptance. For
details on the submission process or any other matter,
please do not hesitate to contact us.
We hope to handle your contribution to Pharmaceuticals
soon.
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