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Protozoan diseases continue to be a serious worldwide
health problem, causing serious social and economic
impacts, especially in developing countries.
Protozooses such as malaria, leishmaniasis,
trypanosomiasis, toxoplasmosis, trichomoniasis,
giardiasis and amoebiasis are responsible for high
mortality and morbidity rates, with the potential to affect
more than 1 billion people worldwide. In this special
Issue, authors are invited to submit review and original
articles related to the recent research in drug design
and discovery, synthesis, and pharmacological
properties (in vitro and in vivo) of natural products and/or
synthetic compounds that have the potential to become
drug candidates for protozoan diseases. As well as
presenting the latest advances in the search for
pharmacological targets for protozoan diseases, with
the aim to provide researchers with the most up-to-date
information in this field. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Because of your expertise in the field of drug sciences, I
kindly invite you to consider publishing your current
work, in the form of a research article or a review, in the
open access electronic journal Pharmaceuticals.
Pharmaceuticals is characterized by an active editorial
board and a dynamic editorial staff. Manuscripts are
peer-reviewed and a final decision is provided to
authors within 4–6 weeks after submission. Papers are
published on the web immediately after acceptance. For
details on the submission process or any other matter,
please do not hesitate to contact us.
We hope to handle your contribution to Pharmaceuticals
soon.
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