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This medical field is constantly seeking innovative
solutions to improve diagnostic and treatment using
tailored approaches. One such advancement lies in the
utilization of novel positron emission tomography (PET)
radiotracers. These cutting-edge radiotracers have
shown immense potential in revolutionizing medical
applications. With the rapid development of medical
imaging technologies, PET has emerged as a powerful
tool for visualizing and quantifying physiological
processes within the human body. Traditional PET
radiotracers have been widely used to diagnose and
monitor various conditions. These innovative
radiotracers are designed to target specific molecular
and cellular processes, allowing for more accurate and
precise imaging. This Special Issue aims to explore the
significance and impact of novel PET radiotracers
toward various medical applications. It is open to
original research and review articles. We look forward to
receiving your contributions. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Because of your expertise in the field of drug sciences, I
kindly invite you to consider publishing your current
work, in the form of a research article or a review, in the
open access electronic journal Pharmaceuticals.
Pharmaceuticals is characterized by an active editorial
board and a dynamic editorial staff. Manuscripts are
peer-reviewed and a final decision is provided to
authors within 4–6 weeks after submission. Papers are
published on the web immediately after acceptance. For
details on the submission process or any other matter,
please do not hesitate to contact us.
We hope to handle your contribution to Pharmaceuticals
soon.
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